G:\M\119TH_PRE\118H1052. XML

[118I11052]

11910 CONGRESS
18T SESSION H o R.

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the limitation
on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions, and for other purposes.

(Original Signature of Member)

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Ms. VAN DUYNE introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase
the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distribu-

tions, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Uplifting First-Time

(Y B S S B O]

Homebuyers Act of 20257.

g:\V\G\121124\G121124.014.xml (95357812)
December 11, 2024 (7:42 p.m.)



G:\M\119TH_PRE\118H1052. XML

2
1 SEC. 2. INCREASING THE LIMITATION ON QUALIFIED

FIRST-TIME HOMEBUYER DISTRIBUTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 72(t)(8)(B)(1) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
“$10,000” and inserting “$50,000”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this Act shall apply to taxable years beginning after De-

cember 31, 2024,

0o N N e B W

g:\V\G\121124\G121124.014.xml (95357812)
December 11, 2024 (7:42 p.m.)




....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions, and for other purposes.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Ms. Van Duyne introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Uplifting First-Time Homebuyers Act of 2025”.


SEC. 2. Increasing the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions.

(a) In general.—Section 72(t)(8)(B)(i) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$10,000” and inserting “$50,000”.


(b) Effective date.—The amendment made by this Act shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024.





  
    G:\M\119TH_PRE\118H1052.XML XXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 12/11/2024 19:42 XXXXXX 12/09/2024 5:34 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXX 
  953578|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [118H1052] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Ms. Van Duyne introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions, and for other purposes. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Uplifting First-Time Homebuyers Act of 2025. 
  2. Increasing the limitation on qualified first-time homebuyer distributions 
  (a) In general Section 72(t)(8)(B)(i) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking  $10,000 and inserting  $50,000. 
  (b) Effective date The amendment made by this Act shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 
 


